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Ship Channel Vessel Restriction Conditions  
Post Hurricane Harvey Lifted 

 
   
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX, USA – Post Hurricane Harvey recovery efforts continue at Port Corpus Christi 
following the Category 4 Hurricane’s devastating strike to the Texas Coast.  The full 47-foot (MLLW) draft 
of the ship channel is open to vessels, and the daylight only transit restriction was removed.  With extensive 
review of hydrographic surveys by the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers and the U.S. Coast Guard, the Corpus 
Christi Ship Channel daylight only transit restrictions were formally lifted by the U.S. Coast Guard on 
Wednesday, September 27th. Vessel traffic remains one-way on the Corpus Christi Ship Channel.  All other 
restrictions have been lifted.      
 
The Corpus Christi Ship Channel closed to all vessel traffic on Thursday, August 24 as Hurricane Harvey 
was bearing down upon the Texas coast.  Following a record six-day closure of the ship channel the U.S. 
Coast Guard Captain of the Port approved the restricted opening of the Corpus Christi Ship Channel.  The 
first vessel arrived at the Inner Harbor soon after on August, 31.   
 
Hurricane Harvey came ashore with Corpus Christi at its southern eye-wall.  Impact to the Corpus Christi 
refining center mainly consisted of loss of power.  Power was restored to Port industries at nearly 100% 
within the week following the storm.  With the daylight only transit restrictions removed, deep draft vessels 
can use the Corpus Christi Ship Channel day and night and are able to provide for the energy needs of our 
nation and our allies.   
 
About Port Corpus Christi 
As a major economic engine of the South Texas Coastal Bend, Port Corpus Christi is the 4th largest port in 
the United States in total tonnage. Strategically located on the western Gulf of Mexico with a 36 mile, 47 
foot (MLLW) deep channel, Port Corpus Christi is a major gateway to international and domestic marine 
commerce. The Port has excellent rail and highway network connectivity via three North American Class-1 
railroads and two major interstates. With an outstanding staff overseen by its seven member commission, 
Port Corpus Christi is clearly the Energy Port of the Americas.  http://www.portcorpuschristi.com/ 
   

• Join the Energy Port of the America’s on Social Media • 
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